

Price comparison for Bay Area Chemical Consortium Agency Members

	ALUMINUM SULFATE 44%-49% Liquid Solution								SULFATE 2% Acidized Liquid Solutions	ALUMINUM SULFATE 5% Acidized Liquid Solutions (Optional bid item)	ALUMINUM SULFATE 7% Acidized Liquid Solution (Optional bid item)	
	North Bay		Sacramento		South Bay		Tri Valley		South Bay	South Bay	North Bay	North Bay
	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	
2022	\$0.8668	\$0.8668	\$0.8668	\$0.8668	\$0.8668	\$1.1393	\$1.1250	\$1.0535	\$1.2192			
2021	\$0.7380	\$0.6750	\$0.8270	\$0.7380	n/a	n/a	n/a	\$1.0686	\$1.1610			
% increase	17%	28%	5%	17%				-1%	5%			

	AMMONIUM SULFATE 40% Liquid Solution				AMMONIUM SULFATE 25% Dry Material
	East Bay		North Bay	South Bay	Tri Valley
	gal	gal	gal	gal	lb
2022	\$1.6900	\$1.6900	\$1.6900	\$1.6900	\$0.5050
2021	\$1.3500	\$1.3500	\$1.3500	\$1.3500	\$0.3950
% increase	25%	25%	25%	25%	28%

	AQUEOUS AMMONIA 19% Solution					
	Central Valley		East Bay	Sacramento	South Bay	Tri Valley
	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal
2022	\$1.9700	\$1.8000	\$1.8000	\$1.4600	\$1.3240	\$4.5700
2021	\$1.1100	\$1.0300	\$1.0300	\$4.7000	\$0.7900	\$3.9700
% increase	77%	75%	-69%	68%	15%	

	CITRIC ACID 48%-52% Liquid			CITRIC ACID dry material	
	Central Valley		North Bay	Sacramento	Tri Valley
	gal	gal	gal	lb	gal
2022	\$21.60	\$22.10	\$21.30	\$4.75	
2021	\$7.16	\$7.57	\$7.16	\$2.00	
% increase	202%	192%	197%	138%	

	FERRIC CHLORIDE								
	Central Valley		East Bay	Marin Sonoma Napa	North Bay	Peninsula	Sacramento	South Bay	Tri Valley
	dry ton	dry ton	dry ton	dry ton	dry ton	dry ton	dry ton	dry ton	dry ton
2022	1169.00	1217.00	1229.00	1233.00	1217.00	1248.00	1203.00	1236.00	
2021	\$773.00	\$731.00	\$731.00	\$764.00	\$764.00	\$746.00	\$727.05	\$731.00	
% increase	51%	66%	68%	61%	59%	67%	65%	68%	

FERROUS CHLORIDE - No bid in 2021 due to cancellation and no bid in 2020 due to covid

HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID - No bidders in 2021 and no bid in 2020 due to covid

	LIQUID CHLORINE One-Ton Cylinders (2,000 lbs)			LIQUID CHLORINE 150-lb Cylinders (Optional bid item)
	Marin Sonoma Napa	North Bay	Sacramento	Sacramento
	ton	ton	ton	lb
2022	\$1,783.00	\$1,648.00	\$1,783.00	\$1.93
2021	\$910.00	\$785.00	\$825.00	\$1.63
% increase	96%	110%	116%	19%

	SODIUM BISULFITE 25% Solution								SODIUM BISULFITE 40% Solution				SODIUM BISULFITE 20% (Optional)		
	Central Valley		East Bay	Marin Sonoma Napa	North Bay		Peninsula	Sacramento	South Bay	Central Valley		East Bay	Peninsula	Sacramento	East Bay
	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal
2022	1.4750	1.4750	1.4750	1.4750	1.4750	1.4750	1.8600	1.4750	1.9950	1.9950	1.9950	1.9950	1.9950	1.4750	
2021	\$1.25	\$1.21	\$1.30	\$1.28	\$1.23	\$1.76	\$1.76	\$1.21	\$1.75	no bid	\$1.75	\$1.86	no bid	no bid	
% increase	18%	22%	13%	15%	20%	6%	22%	14%	14%	7%					

	SODIUM HYDROXIDE 20% (Caustic)	SODIUM HYDROXIDE 25% (Caustic)						SODIUM HYDROXIDE 30% (Caustic)						SODIUM HYDROXIDE 50% (Caustic)					
	Sacramento	Central Valley		Marin Sonoma Napa	Sacramento		South Bay	Tri Valley	North Bay	Sacramento	South Bay	Central Valley	East Bay	Marin Sonoma Napa	North Bay	Sacramento	South Bay	Tri Valley	
	dry ton	dry ton	dry ton	dry ton	dry ton	dry ton	dry ton	dry ton	dry ton	dry ton	dry ton	dry ton	dry ton	dry ton	dry ton	dry ton	dry ton	dry ton	
2022	\$1,019.35	\$975.00	\$873.50	\$967.58	\$975.43	\$907.90	\$860.20	\$957.34	\$1,550.00	\$816.74	\$777.03	\$805.77	\$740.45	\$806.36	\$779.60	\$761.37			
2021	\$614,7400	\$517,0400	\$515,1200	\$569,5800	\$599,9300	\$519,3300	\$476,2200	\$567,9300	\$461,8500	\$416,3500	\$447,2800	\$402,9900	\$436,4400	\$416,8300					
% increase	66%	89%	70%	70%	63%	75%	81%	69%	236%	96%	74%	100%	70%	93%					

	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5%								SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% In 275-gal totes (Optional bid item)	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% In Drums (Optional bid item)	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% In Caryboys (Optional bid)	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 5.25% (Optional bid item)		
	Central Valley		East Bay	Marin Sonoma Napa	North Bay	Peninsula	Sacramento	South Bay	Tri Valley	North Bay	Central Valley	North Bay	Sacramento	Sacramento
	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal	gal
2022	1.5469	1.4322	1.464	1.3852	1.4916	1.5166	1.4642	1.4424	2.01	no bid	no bid	no bid	2.15	0.929
2021	\$0.71240	\$0.70400	\$0.76910	\$0.73660	\$0.73900	\$0.75400	\$0.73770	\$0.70150	no bid	no bid	no bid	na	0.66	
% increase	117%	103%	90%	88%	102%	101%	98%	106%						41%